THE DISTRICT BOARD OF TRUSTEES OF
PENSACOLA JUNIOR COLLEGE, FLORIDA
1000 COLLEGE BOULEVARD
PENSACOLA, FL 32504-8998

October 18, 2005

BID NO. 5, 2005/2006

TABULATION OF BIDSON STUDIO LIGHT DIMMING SYSTEM FOR WSRE-TV
AND
PENSACOLA JUNIOR COLLEGE

ITEM _QTYJUNIT BSL PRODUCTIONS, INC. MAINSTAGE THEATRICAL MURPHY LIGHTING SECOA . INC.
1 lLot $54,266.00 $46,499.00 $46,258.00 $53,559.00
2 1 Each
A. No Bid No Bid $12,980.00 No Bid
(B).R $14,344.00 $12,714.00 $19,330.00 $15,835.00
8.R No Bid No Bid $10,814.00 N/A
3 1 Each $1,155.77 $1,058.00 $1,192.00 $1,149.00

BID TABULATION, RECOMMENDATION, AND PROTEST

Bid tabulations with award recommendations are posted in the Purchasing Department.
Posting of tabulations normally is completed within three to five days after bid opening.
Failure to protest within the time limit prescribed in Section 120.57(3)(b), Florida Statutes
Shdll constitute awaiver of proceedings under Chapter 120 and these rules

| hereby certify that the prices and bidders herein are valid and have been received in
Compliance with Pensacola Junior College Administrative Code and Florida Law.

Angie C. Jones, Director
Purchasing and Auxiliary Services



