PENSACOLA STATE COLLEGE
ITB 1-2010/2011

BID TABULATION

QTY SIGMAnet En Pointe Technologies Champsystems
UNIT PRICE TOTAL UNIT PRICE TOTAL UNIT PRICE TOTAL

1 28 1.55 43.40 1.36 38.08 .68 19.04
2 28 1.60 44.80 1.85 51.80 .95 26.60
3 28 1.65 46.20 2.21 61.88 1.25 35.00
4 22 1.67 36.74 No Bid No Bid .85 18.70
5 22 1.72 37.84 No Bid No Bid 1.17 25.74
6 22 1.77 38.94 No Bid No Bid 1.33 29.26
7 5 630.00 3,150.00 594.02 2,970.10 650.00 3,250.00
8 12 60.00 720.00 No Bid No Bid 140.00 1,680.00
9 42 15.00 630.00 No Bid No Bid 100.00 4,200.00
10| 24 700.00 16,800.00 826.08 19,825.92 925.00 22,200.00
11 12 850.00 10,200.00 1,001.29 12,015.48 1,128.00 13,536.00
12 15 1,247.00 18,712.50 1,470.91 22,063.65 1,355.00 20,325
13| 31 697.50 21,622.50 822.07 25,484.17 895.00 27,745.00
14 | 45 250.00 11,250.00 296.4 13,338.00 325.00 14,625.00
15 3 2,850.00 8,550.00 2,710.52 8,131.56 2,975.00 8,925.00
16 | 29 647.50 18,777.50 765.91 22,211.39 700.00 *%*20,300.00
17 8 1,497.50 11,980.00 1,766.30 14,130.40 1,605.00 12,840.00
18 3 5,584.80 16754.40 No Price No Price .90 2.70
19| 24 69.00 1,656.00 296.40 7,113.60 260.00 6,240.00
20 | 24 59.00 1,416.00 237.32 5,695.68 110.00 2,640.00
21 2 3,365.00 6,730.00 4,349.71 8,699.42 6,775.00 13,550.00
22 1 0.00 0.00 No Bid No Bid 0.00 00.00
SUBTOTAL 149,196.82 173,005.46 172,213.04
SHIPPING 1,000.00 00.00 2,200.00

TOTAL 150,196.82 *173,005.46 174,413.04
DELIVERY AND | Delivery 14 days ARO 10-14 Days ARO By September 2010

INSTALLATION

Install TDB after delivery

RECOMMENDED AWARD TO: SIGMAnet

* Quotes for items 10 through 20 contained additional items, quantities, and no bids

** Quote based on quantity of 39 changed to quantity of 29 per Bid Form

Bid tabulations with award recommendations are posted in the Purchasing Department. Posting of tabulations normally is completed
within three to five days after bid opening.

Failure to file a protest within time prescribed in Section 120.57 (3), Florida Statutes, or failure to post the bond or other security
required by law within the time allowed for filing a bond shall constitute a waiver of proceeding under Chapter 120, Florida Statutes.

I hereby certify that the prices and bidders herein are valid and have been received in compliance with Pensacola Junior College
Administrative Code and Florida Law.

Angie C. Jones,

Purchasing and Auxiliary Services

Director




