
Bid Tabulation ‐ ITB 3, 2008/2009
Sign Language Interpretive Services

Deaf & Hard of 
Hearing Services

 Deaf 
Communications 
Specialists 

Professional 
Interpreting 
Services for the 
Deaf

Sign Language Services

Minimum # of minutes to be billed per 
assignment (day rate) No Bid 120 120 120

 Amount for minimum duration No Bid 80.00$                    80.00$                   76.00$                           

 Hourly rate for additional hours No Bid 40.00$                    40.00$                   38.00$                           

 Amount for minimum duration (Team: 
two interpreters) No Bid 160.00$                  160.00$                 152.00$                         

Minimum # of minutes to be billed per 
assignment (night rate) No Bid 120 120 120

Amount for minimum duration No Bid 90.00$                    90.00$                   86.00$                           

Hourly rate for additional hours No Bid 45.00$                    45.00$                   43.00$                           

 Amount for minimum duration (Team: 
two interpreters) No Bid 180.00$                  180.00$                 172.00$                         

BID TABULATION, RECOMMENDATION, AND PROTEST

Bid tabulations with award recommendations are posted in the Purchasing Department. Posting of tabulations normally
is completed within three to five days after proposal opening. Failure to protest within the time limit prescribed
in Section 120.57 (3)(b), Florida Statutes shall constitute a waiver of proceedings under Chapter 120 and these rules.

I hereby certify that the prices and bidders herein are valid and have been received in compliance with Pensacola Junior
College Administrative Code and Florida Law.
___________________
Angie C. Jones
Director, Purchasing and Auxiliary Services


