Recommend Award to Highlighted ltems

Bid 26, 2005/2006, Dental Materials and Supplies

ITEM | QUANTITY DESCRIPTION UNIT |Becker-Parkin |Benco Henry Schein |[Nowak Patterson |Young
Neo Pro Non-Latex Powder-Free Chloroprened Examination gloves, SMALL MPG-888 S
1 120 |100/box box $7.25 $10.58 $7.64 |No Bid $7.74 |No Bid
2 60 Safeskin, Nitrile Powder-Free Examination gloves, SMALL 53431 100/box PURPLE box $7.00 $10.33 $8.86 |No Bid $8.27 |No Bid
NeoPro Non-Latex Powder-Free Chloroprene Examination gloves, MEDIUM NPG-888-M
3 140 |100/box box $7.25 $10.58 $7.64 |No Bid $7.74 |No Bid
4 60 Safeskin, Nitrile Powder-Free Examination gloves, MEDIUM 53432 100/box PURPLE box $7.00 $10.33 $8.86 |No Bid $8.27 |No Bid
NeoPro Non-Latex Powder-Free Chloroprene Examination gloves, LARGE NPG-888-L
5 55 100/box box $7.25 $10.58 $7.64 |No Bid $7.74 |No Bid
6 35 Safeskin, Nitrile Powder-Free Examination gloves, LARGE 53433 100/box PURPLE box $7.00 $10.33 $8.86 |No Bid $8.27 |No Bid
NeoPro Non-Latex Powder-Free Chloroprene Examination gloves, XS NPG-888-XL
7 30 100/box box $7.25 $10.58 $7.64 |No Bid $7.74 |No Bid
8 20 Safeskin, Nitrile Powder-Free Examination gloves, XSMALL 53430 100/box box $7.00 $10.33 $8.86 |No Bid $8.27 |No Bid
9 20 DASH Nitrile PF with Aloe Powder-Free Examination gloves, SMALL 100/box box $7.25 $10.17 $8.03 |No Bid $7.74 |No Bid
10 30 DASH Nitrile PF with Aloe Powder-Free Examination gloves, MEDIUM 100/box box $7.25 $10.17 $8.03 |No Bid $7.74 |No Bid
11 8 Com-Fit Mask SUPER SENSITIVE WHITE 50/box box $10.25 $11.63 $12.08 |No Bid $11.29 |No Bid
12 25 Crosstex Isofluid EARLOOP MASK, Latex-free, blue 50/box NO SUBSTITUTE box $5.75 $6.65 $5.99 $8.81 $7.74 |No Bid
13 16 Patient bibs, 13"x19",Plastic back LAVENDER 500/case case $19.00 $21.25 $14.64 $21.47 $19.59 |No Bid
14 11 Bracket tray covers, 8 1/2" x 2 1/4" LAVENDER 1000/case case $17.50 $21.99 $20.27 |No Bid $21.10 |No Bid
15 21 Plastic cups 5 0z LAVENDER 1000/case case $16.50 $19.25 $12.99 $16.21 $16.23 |No Bid
16 16 Patient throws, WHITE 26" x 36 100/box HOOKER, NO SUBSTITUTE box $16.50 $16.88 $17.54 |No Bid $16.99 |No Bid
17 20 Bitewing Tabs, Pressure, No Peel 500/box box $3.00 $4.13 $4.13 $3.98 $4.49 |No Bid
18 2 Septocaine cartridge 4% with ephinephrine 1:100,00 50/can can $26.25 $28.75 $26.43 |No Bid $24.88 |No Bid
19 9 Lidocaine cartridge 2% 1.8 ml ADA approved with ephinephrine 1:100,000, 50/can can $12.00 $16.42 $15.16 $16.93 $15.82 |No Bid
20 1 Carbocaine 3% HCI plain, Cook-waite 50/can can $21.00 $22.98 $21.44 $19.16 $21.52 |No Bid
21 4 Articulating paper THIN, blue 12/books/box box $3.00 $8.50 $3.50 $11.20 $9.44 |No Bid
22 4 Saliva ejectors, disposable 250/bag white bag $14.25 $3.03 $1.57 $2.53 $14.72 |No Bid
23 4 Spandex-Lip Retractor, plastic 2/set, ADULT pkg $15.75 $26.13 $23.39 |No Bid $14.72 |No Bid
24 2 Spandex-Lip Retractor, plastic 2/set, CHILD pkg $15.25 $27.53 $22.61 |No Bid $14.72 |No Bid
25 4 NUPRO MINT Neutral Fluoride Gel Dentsply Professional 16 oz bottle each $28.00 $17.42 $18.71 |No Bid $17.33 |No Bid
26 4 NUPRO APPLE CINNAMON Neutral Fluoride Gel Dentsply Professional 16 oz bottle each $28.00 $17.42 $18.71 |No Bid $17.33 |No Bid
27 4 Instrument cleaning brush by MILTEX nylon bristles 6/pkg pkg $3.50 $10.98 $3.89 $20.16 $13.78 |No Bid
28 5 Seal-Tight disposable air/water syringe tip PINNACLE Bulk 1500/box box $175.00] $194.89 $180.95 |No Bid $169.87 |No Bid
29 3 Cotton Tip Applicators 6" 100/box box $4.50 $3.00 $6.23 $4.80 $6.79 |No Bid
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30 2 Tongue depressors, 500/box, non-sterile box $4.75 $6.88 $4.91 |No Bid $6.76 |No Bid
31 8 Mouth Props 2/pkg CHILD BLACK Non-latex pkg $9.00 $9.99 $10.13 |No Bid $10.95 |No Bid
32 12 Prophy jet cleaning tool each $4.00 $3.75 $5.69 $2.61 $2.57 |No Bid
Readymatic dental chem-pack Kodak contains 2-1 gal Developer replinisher and 2-1 gal
33 15 Fixer replenisher case $28.00 $38.70 $32.63 $28.52 $33.60 |No Bid
34 2 Roller Transport clean-up film Kodak 8x10 50/box box $60.00 $66.74 $57.71 |No Bid $53.04 |No Bid
35 2 GBX Kodak for manual(hand tank) twin pack 6qts case $68.00 $13.58 $12.08 $66.90 $35.11 |No Bid
36 6 Aim-safe Needle Recapping Device AUTOCLAVE 4/pkg pkg $16.50 $18.13 $17.54 |No Bid $16.80 |No Bid
37 6 Kodak Insight IP-21C 1 film barrier packets 100/box size 2 film box $37.00 $42.00 $37.71 |No Bid $37.37 |No Bid
38 7 Kodak Insight 10-41 1 film packets, paper 25/box box $40.00 $46.04 $42.11 $41.85 $41.15 |No Bid
39 10 Kodak Tmat G Panoramic film 15x30 50/box TMG-15 box $60.00 $68.61 $57.71 $64.00 $57.76 |No Bid
40 15 Kodak Duplicating X-Omat film 15x30 cm 50/box box $66.00 $89.86 $74.09 $82.00 $74.37 |No Bid
41 2 Bitewing mount 100/pkg Rinn 4H #2 #30-6040 pkg $15.00 $15.05 $21.83 $15.48 $21.10 |No Bid
42 4 Bitewing mount 100/pkg Rinn 4V #2 #30-6042 pkg $15.00 $17.24 $25.19 $17.73 $23.37 |No Bid
43 6 Stabe film holder-Rinn bite block 100/box box $16.50 $20.73 $17.54 $18.84 $17.33 |No Bid
44 2 Flap film tabs-Microcopy stick on film holder 500/box box $21.00 $23.56 $22.61 |No Bid $21.86 |No Bid
45 2 Rinn protective mount envelopes #20 size 6x12, 50-0849 box $21.00 $22.53 $24.95 $21.00 $24.54 |No Bid
46 25 Self seal sterilization pouch 2 3/4" x 9" 200/box box $5.75 $7.99 $6.92 $6.19 $7.36 |No Bid
47 20 Self seal sterilization pouch 3 1/2 " x 9" 200/box box $6.00 $20.99 $7.11 $6.50 $7.51 |No Bid
48 8 Self seal sterilization pouch 3 1/2 " x 5 1/4 200/box box $5.75 $9.59 $8.29 $6.25 $8.27 |No Bid
49 2 Self seal sterilization pouch 2 1/4 " x 4" 200/box box $5.75 $6.49 $5.22 |No Bid $6.00 |No Bid
50 2 Self seal sterilization pouch 7 1/2 " x 13" 200/box box $20.00 $21.99 $19.49 |No Bid $17.33 |No Bid
51 12 Sterilization indicator Tape 1/2 x 60 roll roll $3.25 $2.79 $3.11 |No Bid $5.47 $4.47
52 4 Dual purpose nylon sterilization tubing 6"x100ft. each $8.50 $18.73 $11.69 |No Bid $15.67 | $14.98
53 2 Dual purpose nylon sterilization tubing 2"x100ft. each $4.50 $8.80 $4.74 |No Bid $9.02 $7.04
54 10 Nyclave Impulse Heating Element for Nyclave Heat Sealer #110401 each $5.25] $135.98 $6.08 |No Bid $4.30 $4.44
55 10 Teflon Insulator for Nyclave Impulse Heat Sealer #110501 each $5.25 $7.39 $5.84 |No Bid $4.30 $4.44
56 10 Teflon Cover for Nyclave Impulse Heat Sealer #110301 each $5.25 $7.39 $6.08 |No Bid $4.30 $4.44
57 9 Autoclave Cleaner Omni-Cleaner Plus autoclave cleaning solution 16 oz bottle each $7.00 $9.17 $8.03 |No Bid $9.78 |No Bid
58 6 UltraSonic solution #4 Tartar and Stain, remover gallon each $25.00 $16.49 $13.83 $20.00 $15.06 |No Bid
59 15 General Purpose Ultra Sonic Solution 4/gal/case case $38.00 $16.49 $13.83 $80.00 $55.87 |No Bid
Bacti-Stat Antimicrobial handwash with aloe vera and lanolin Huntington NO SUBSTITUTE
60 15 PATTERSON DENTAL case $96.00 $90.28 $31.43 |No Bid $30.16 |No Bid
61 15 Biozyme, TL Enzymatic Instrument cleaner & Presoak 32 oz bottle each $31.00 $41.08 $31.97 |No Bid $31.52 |No Bid
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62 4 RAMCLEAN Dental Vacuum line Cleaner Non-Foaming Super-Chlorinated 40-10z packets | box $15.00 $17.23 $20.27 |No Bid $17.93 |No Bid
63 1 Denticator disposable Tapered Brush Latex-Free 100/pkg medium pkg $64.00 $52.91 $54.98 |No Bid $58.32 | $65.90
64 20 Act fluoride anti-cavity rinse 48-10z bottle/case MINT case $16.25 $17.71 $17.15 $16.50 $17.74 |No Bid
65 12 Act fluoride anti-cavity rinse 48-10z bottle/case BUBBLE GUM case $16.25 $17.71 $17.15 $16.50 $17.74 |No Bid
66 1 Dri-Angle saliva control LARGE 320/box box $11.00 $12.19 $9.74 $8.24 $9.25 |No Bid
67 2 Dri-Angle saliva control SMALL 400/box box $11.00 $12.19 $9.74 $8.44 $9.25 |No Bid
68 2 Non-woven sponges gauge 2" x 2" 4 ply 5000/case case $25.00 $53.99 $1.40 $25.79 $44.51 |No Bid
69 62 Kimberly Clark control gowns 69981 M/L 10/pkg BLUE pkg $10.00 $10.98 $20.27 $12.50 $10.95 |No Bid
70 4 Oris CHX oral rinse 160z. Bottle MINT flavor each $4.00 $7.44 $6.44 |No Bid $5.78 |No Bid
71 6 Glide floss picks 50/pkg pkg $7.25 $7.45 $7.79 |No Bid $5.95 |No Bid
72 10 Con-Frim ST, steam biological indicator 25/box box $59.00 $57.94 $84.86 |No Bid $54.32 |No Bid
Endodontic Syringe with 12cc Luer Irrigation Needle, disposable, non-sterile, 23 gauge
73 1 100/box box $27.00 $29.44 $13.25 |No Bid $32.09 |No Bid
74 1 Complete Curing Light Sleeve-Dental Disposable, Cover the Curing light handle 250/box box $21.00 $23.13 $23.39 |No Bid $22.61 |No Bid
75 11 Bib-Eze Disposable Bib Holder Clice Craig 250/pkg pkg |No Bid $29.25 $8.57 |No Bid $8.27 |No Bid
76 2 Formula 2000 Cleaner Air Techniques 2/bottle/pkg pkg $34.00 $46.45 $37.04 |No Bid $36.20 |No Bid
77 3 Spray 2000 Air Techniques box $26.50 $28.50 $29.24 |No Bid $28.65 |No Bid
78 3 Clear Image Radiographic Cleaner qt. each $23.00 $33.17 $29.24 |No Bid $26.05 |No Bid
Disposable infection control barrier for Nitrous Oxide Inhaler Liners White Gaps, Inc
79 2 ADULT size 50/box box $19.25 $20.28 $20.90 |No Bid $19.44 |No Bid
80 7 Reach Access Dailey Flosser 48/case case $27.00 $3.83 $30.26 $29.50 $28.65 |No Bid
81 25 CaviWipes XL Disinfecting Towelettes canister 12/case #13-1150 case $78.00 $8.89 $8.57 $85.00 $101.93 |No Bid
82 6 CaviCide Surface Disinfectant 4/gallon/case #13-1000 case $58.00 $21.72 $16.99 $67.84 $74.00 |No Bid
83 3 Breath Wand Tongue Cleaner Oolitt Advantage 24/pkg pkg $40.00 $71.88 $31.97 |No Bid $17.74 |No Bid
Dappen Dishes disposable, Plastic assorted colors 1000/box Henry Schein NO
84 9 SUBSTITUTE box $35.00 $15.76 $34.31 |No Bid No Bid No Bid
85 33 Full Chair Cover Protector 36"x80" 175/roll roll $50.50 $55.63 $31.19 $29.29 |No Bid No Bid
86 5 Etching Gel 4/pkg with Acid Etch Tips pkg $6.75 $9.85 $8.83 $11.96 $23.78 | $35.99
87 1 Needles,Plastic,Hub 27 gauge Long, YELLOW 100/box box $7.00 $7.19 $7.01 $7.73 $7.93 |No Bid
88 3 Needles, Plastic Hub 30 gauge Short BLUE 100/box box $7.00 $7.19 $7.01 $7.73 $7.93 |No Bid
89 5 Quala Cone shaped face masks, pink 50/bx box $5.00 $5.29 $6.97 |No Bid $8.27 |No Bid
90 3 Cavit- W White Medium Set  28g Jar jar $13.00 $14.13 $14.03 $14.47 $14.16 |No Bid
91 1 Miracle Mix kit $125.00 $142.06 $133.37 $133.00 $47.53 |No Bid
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92 1 Sealant Tips Bent Brush Tip 100/ pkg pkg $48.00|No Bid $41.33 |No Bid $41.49 |No Bid
93 1 Expasyl - Gingival Retraction Paste Introductory Kit kit |No Bid $267.50 $244.91 |No Bid $258.96 |No Bid
94 1 Wizard Wedges- Waterpik, Wide 1000/bx box $25.50 $27.81 $26.12 $52.00 $25.63 |No Bid
95 2 Sycamore anatomical Wedges, Red/16, 400/pkg pkg $24.50|No Bid $26.90 $22.90 $27.14 |No Bid
96 1 Tooth Slooth 4/pkg pkg $13.25 $13.50 $14.03 |No Bid $13.55 |No Bid
97 1 Amalgam, Tytin, 400 mg., 500 capsules Regular Set gal $405.00] $451.69 $310.38 |No Bid $351.08 |No Bid
98 4 Tofflemire Matrix Band /.001, thin, size 1 100/pkg pkg $18.00 $4.63 $19.10 |No Bid $0.98 | $15.92
Vitrebond, Light cured glass lonomer, Liner/Base 3 M ESPE Kit, 9 gm powder, 5 ml liquid,
99 2 spoon, 2 mixing pads kit $133.00] $149.50 $123.71 $147.15 $135.86 |No Bid
100 2 Young Disposable Prophy angles, latex free, purple, soft, 200/box box $80.00] $104.10 $83.45 |No Bid $81.50 | $71.39
101 1 Microbrushes, Microbrush Co. in clear dispensing tubes/ Purple, NO SUBSTITUTE 100/pkg| pkg $4.00 $16.25 $22.61 $4.44 $5.44 |No Bid
102 4 Barrier Film, 4" x 6" barrier film, blue, 1200 sheet per roll each $10.00 $14.49 $12.26 $13.07 $14.16 |No Bid
103 10 3M ESPE Clinpro Sealant Syringe 1.2 ml each $13.00 $14.13 $12.29 $12.83 $14.15 |No Bid
104 10 Sharps containers, 3.5 x3/5 x 5" ea each $4.75 $4.45 $5.69 |No Bid $3.85 |No Bid
105 2 Etch rite tips, Prebent, Needle, applicator tips, 100/bx box $14.00 $15.00 $15.20 $14.10 $15.06 |No Bid
106 2 Coe Tray Cleaner, Dustless formula, 1/27 lbs. 575 g bottle $16.75 $18.13 $18.56 $16.48 $18.08 |No Bid
107 1 Overglove Biotrol 1000/bx pkg $45.00 $35.00 $6.23 |No Bid $49.45 |No Bid
108 5 VioNexus No Touch Dispenser each $60.00 $67.66 $70.19 $61.51 $64.89 |No Bid
109 5 VioNexus Healthcare Personnel Handwash 1 Liter 2/pkg pkg $28.00 $37.88 $38.99 |No Bid $37.21 |No Bid
110 3 Round, Latch, size 6, 10/pkg pkg $8.50 $11.73 $9.26 $9.08 $10.38 |No Bid
111 3 Inverted Cone, FG, Size 39 10/pkg pkg $10.25 $4.56 $11.92 $9.08 $10.38 |No Bid
112 3 Tapered Fissure, FG, Size 170 10/pkg pkg $10.25 $11.63 $7.92 $9.08 $10.38 |No Bid
113 3 Straight Fissure, FG, Size 57, 10/pkg pkg $7.75 $11.63 $7.92 $9.08 $10.38 |No Bid
114 3 Pear Shape, FG, Size 330 10/pkg pkg $7.75 $11.38 $7.92 $9.08 $10.38 |No Bid
115 3 Straight Fissure, FG, Size 560, 10/pkg pkg $10.25 $11.63 $12.86 $9.08 $12.45 |No Bid
116 3 Tapered Fissure, FG, Size 702 10/pkg pkg $10.25 $11.63 $7.92 $9.08 $12.45 |No Bid
117 3 Finishing Bur, 7902, Head size, 1/10, FG, 5 Pkg pkg $23.00 $24.56 $3.89 $41.93 $48.28 |No Bid
118 1 Nupro prophy paste, dentsply preventive care MEDIUM TROPICAL FRUIT 200/box box $24.00 $39.66 $35.09 $37.00 $34.35 |No Bid
119 1 Nupro prophy paste, dentsply preventive care FINE BUBBLE GUM 200/box box $35.00 $39.66 $35.09 $37.00 $34.35 |No Bid
120 1 Red 25 gauge short; plastic hub 100/bx box $6.50 $7.19 $7.01 $7.73 $7.93 |No Bid
121 1 Red 25 gauge long; plastic hub 100/bx box $6.50 $7.19 $7.01 $7.73 $7.93 |No Bid
122 1 Yellow 27 gauge Long; plastic hub 100/bx box $6.50 $7.19 $7.01 $7.73 $7.93 |No Bid
123 1 Yellow 27 gauge Short; plastic hub 100/bx box $6.50 $7.19 $7.01 $7.73 $7.93 |No Bid
124 1 Blue 30 gauge xshrt; plastic hub 100/bx box $6.50 $7.19 $7.01 $7.73 $7.93 |No Bid
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125 1 Blue 30 gauge Short; plastic hub 100/bx box $6.50 $7.19 $7.01 $7.73 $7.93 |No Bid
126 1 Yellow 27 gauge Long; plastic hub 100/bx box $6.50 $7.19 $7.01 $7.73 $7.93 |No Bid
127 2 PerioPro Chemistry, 3 gts. Dev., 3 gts. Fixer Air Techniques case $24.00 $24.56 $25.83 |No Bid $23.37 |No Bid
128 1 Limelight Liner, 4- 1.2 m. syringes + 8 dispensers kit $23.50 $33.11 $26.51 |No Bid $25.48 |No Bid
129 2 Tofflemire Matrix Band Retainer/ universal each $7.00 $8.97 $8.18 $6.50 $8.68 |No Bid
130 1 Light Handle Covers, "T" sleeve 4"x5 3/4/ plastic disposable 500/box box $10.00 $15.69 $12.66 |No Bid $18.08 | $13.58
131 1 Xray Cover Sleeve, 15" x 26 " plastic disposable 225/box box $23.00 $22.56 $18.32 |No Bid $22.61 |No Bid
132 10 Cord Packing Instruments, CSI Serrated each $19.50 $20.81 $21.05 $15.17 $16.23 |No Bid
133 1 Kwik-Bite- kerr Total care/Pinnacle (15 per box) box $34.00 $41.29 $42.89 |No Bid $41.49 |No Bid
134 1 Future Floor Wax (In place of model gloss) 27 fl.oz. bottle each |No Bid No Bid $17.15 |No Bid $15.06 |No Bid
135 6 Lab Plaster, 50 Ibs, Modern Materials, Regular set 50 Ibs./carton ctn $22.00 $40.86 $29.87 $29.51 $15.48 |No Bid
136 6 LabStone Buff 50 Ibs case $28.00 $36.72 $31.19 $31.52 $31.67 |No Bid
137 1 Lab Pumice, 40 Ibs. fine box $35.00 $39.99 $42.89 $72.61 $30.16 |No Bid
138 1 Lab Pumice, 40 Ibs. medium box $35.00 $39.99 $42.89 $72.61 $30.16 |No Bid
139 3 Alginate, Jeltrate Plus/22 Ibs/normal set Bulk/ 22lb carton ctn $180.00 $257.50 $187.97 $186.05 $195.55 |No Bid
140 2 Extrude Putty, Impression Putty .278 ml base, 278 ml Catalyst, 1 spacer, 2 spoons kit $70.00 $77.44 $66.88 |No Bid $73.95 |No Bid
141 3 Hydroplastic TAK Custom Tray Material 1 Ib. Jar yellow jar $43.00 $41.21 $41.33 |No Bid $40.58 |No Bid
142 3 Hydroplastic TAK Custom Tray Material 1 Ib. Jar blue jar $43.00 $41.21 $41.33 |No Bid $40.58 |No Bid
143 2 Hydroplastic TAK Custom Tray Material 1 Ib. Jar pink jar $43.00 $41.21 $41.33 |No Bid $40.58 |No Bid
144 4 Baseplate wax, Pink regular bx 5 Ibs. box $27.00 $51.57 $19.49 $32.00 $33.18 |No Bid
145 6 Utility Rope Wax, white 55/box box $10.50 $10.90 $12.47 $8.00 $10.53 |No Bid
146 6 Protemp Garant Cartridges A-1 each $98.00] $112.00 $32.99 $110.34 $105.66 |No Bid
147 3 Temp Bridge Resin, Liquid bottle $15.75 $17.38 $17.93 $17.00 $17.33 |No Bid
148 3 Acrylic Repair Liquid 1Qt. Liquid resin clear bottle $36.00 $30.21 $21.83 $15.00 $18.08 |No Bid
149 5 Coe Flex Plysulfide Rubber Base Base and Catalyst Regular Body Impression Material each $26.00 $28.38 $29.24 $25.80 $22.61 |No Bid
150 6 Copalite, Varnish bottle $6.00 $9.65 $9.74 $10.02 $9.78 |No Bid
151 6 6x6 Non Latex Rubber Dam Material Medium gauge box $15.50 $16.85 $13.25 $22.00 $13.02 |No Bid
152 10 IRM Ivory Dentsply/Caulk 38gm powder & 14ml liquid pkg $33.00 $37.06 $29.49 $33.50 $34.69 |No Bid
153 8 Glass lonomer Intro Pkg (33g powder, 12 ml liquid, mixing pad) pkg $77.00] $108.75 $81.11 $84.55 $79.24 |No Bid
154 8 Shofu HY-Bond Zinc Phosphate Kit (60g powder, 25ml liquid, dispenser pkg $25.00 $27.08 $71.75 $64.56 $26.24 |No Bid
155 8 Polycarboxylate Intro Pkg (20g powder, 14,ml liquid, mixing pad) kit $16.50 $56.15 $54.98 $54.66 |No Bid No Bid
156 1 Coe Pak Automix pkg $54.00 $59.25 $56.15 $53.86 $66.63 |No Bid
157 10 Coe Pak Standard Package pkg $44.00 $48.25 $49.91 $42.89 $48.70 |No Bid
158 10 Articulating Paper Holders each $5.00 $8.49 $5.45 $5.00 $17.33 |No Bid

Page 5 of 6




Recommend Award to Highlighted ltems Bid 26, 2005/2006, Dental Materials and Supplies

Bid tabulations with award recommendations are posted in the Purchasing Department.
Posting of tabulations normally is completed within three to five days after bid opening.
Failure to protest within the time limit prescribed in Section 120.57 (3)(b), Florida Statutes
shall constitute a waiver of proceedings under Chapter 120 and these rules.

| hereby certify that the prices and bidders herein are valid and have been received in
compliance with Pensacola Junior College Administrative Code and Florida Law.

Angie C. Jones
Director, Purchasing and Auxiliary Services
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