Quantity
Item1l 7,000 UnitPrice
Total
8,000 Unit Price
Total
9,000 Unit Price
Total
Option 2
7,000
8,000
9,000
Option 3
7,000
8,000
9,000
Alterations
Item 4 Cost per page
Item 5 Addtl cost/1,000
References
URL
Addendum

Item 2

Item 3

Boyd
Brothers *

$3.11
$21,770.00
$2.95
$23,600.00
$2.89
$26,010.00

$795.00
$838.00
$882.00

$1,103.00
$1,191.00
$1,279.00

$50.00

$2,350.00
Yes
Yes
Yes

Creasey
Printing ***

$10,820.00
$12,013.00
$13,112.00

No Bid
No Bid
No Bid

$675.00
$725.00
$775.00

$20.00

$1,143.00
Yes
Yes
Yes

Data
Reproductions

Corp.
$1.47
$10,290.00
$1.41
$11,280.00
$1.36
$12,240.00

n/a
n/a
n/a

$299.00
$326.00
$354.00

$12.00

$960.00
Yes
Yes
Yes

RFQ P5 2011/2012 - Tabulation
Printing of College Catalog

Maracle
Press

$2.80
$19,600.00
$2.70
$21,600.00
$2.61
$23,490.00

$490.00
$520.00
$540.00

$840.00
$920.00
$990.00

$25.00

$2,090.00
Yes
Yes
Yes

PRIDE
Enterprises

$1.85
$12,950.00
$1.80
$14,400.00
$1.75
$15,750.00

$210.00
$240.00
$270.00

$463.00
$514.30
$562.50

$13.00

$1,500.00
Yes
Yes
No

The PA
Hutchison
Company *
$1.741
$12,187.00
$1.683
$13,464.00
$1.651
$14,859.00

$283.00
$298.00
$327.00

$374.00
$404.00
$448.00

$15.00
$1,279.00
Yes
No (Sample Yes)
Yes

Rich Printing

$2.11
$14,770.00
$2.00
$16,000.00
$1.93
$17,370.00

$2.20 **
$2.08 **
$2.00 **

$2.24 **
$2.12 **
$2.04 **

$2.96

$1,268.00
Yes
No
Yes

Tom White
the Printer *

$3.5057

$24,539.90

$3.3925

$27,140.00

$3.3053

$29,747.70

$3,164.00
$3,523.00
$3,864.00

$3,444.00
$3,829.00
$4,197.00

$9.00

$2,600.00
No
No
Yes

Webcom *

$1.60
$11,200.00
$1.55
$12,400.00
$1.51
$13,590.00

n/a
n/a
n/a

$11,597.02
$12,718.14
$13,839.24

$30.00
$1,470.00
Yes
No (Sample Yes)
Yes

* Boyd Brothers, The PA Hutchison Company, Tom White the Printer and Webcom had errors in calculating total cost; the unit price prevails.
** Rich Printing pricing for options 2 & 3 are "total unit price per book".
**%* Creasey Printing did not provide a unit price for item 1.

Recommended Award: Data Reproductions Corporation

Mignone
Comm.
Inc

No Bid
No Bid
No Bid
No Bid
No Bid
No Bid

Trend

Offset

Printing
No Bid
No Bid
No Bid
No Bid
No Bid
No Bid

T™MT
Printing

No Bid
No Bid
No Bid
No Bid
No Bid
No Bid



