RFQ Tab P5 - 2010/2011
Camera Equipment

Calumet Troxell Custom Media
Vendors B&H Photo* Adorama** Photographlc Communications, inc. Intellis Media W.B. Hunt Services
item Qty |unitPrice | Total Price [Unit Price | Total Price |Unit Price | Total Price |Unit Price | Total Price |Unit Price | Total Price |Unit Price | Total Price |Unit Price | Total Price
1 1 6,125.00] 6,125.00| 6,227.70] 6,227.70| 6,200.00] 6,200.00{ No Bid No Bid 6,910.92| 6,910.92| 5,500.00] 5,500.00| 6,595.04| 6,595.04
2 1 1,599.00] 1,599.00|] 1,107.70{ 1,107.70| No Bid No Bid 1,063.00] 1,063.00] 1,128.60] 1,128.60] 1,114.75| 1,114.75| 1,267.22] 1,267.22
3 1 |inciuded In item #2 247.70 247.70| No Bid No Bid 189.00 189.00 199.80 199.80 209.50 209.50 225.90 225.90
4 2 |included in item #2 137.70 275.40| NoBid No Bid 135.00 270.00 141.48 282.96 149.50 299.00 158.68 317.36
S 1 |inciuded in item #2 147.70 147.70| NoBid No Bid 136.00 136.00 156.60 156.60 151.60 151.60 165.29 165.29
6 1 included in item #2 69.95 69.95| NoBid No Bid No Bid No Bid 42.12 42.12 70.80 70.80 231.14 231.14
7 1 72.99 72.99 72.95 72.95 80.00 80.00 73.00 73.00 78.83 78.83 75.90 75.90 76.03 76.03
8 1 156.99 156.99 181.41 181.41] NoBid No Bid 203.00 203.00 195.48 195.48 183.95 183.95 208.26 208.26
9 1 515.00 515.00 607.70 607.70] No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid 647.95 647.95 509.25 509.25 534.94 534.94
10 1 18.56 18.56 34,95 34,95 50.00 50.00] No Bid No Bid 52.87 52.87 19.50 19.50 21.69 21.69
11 1 149.00 149.00 177.00 177.00 175.00 175.00] No Bid No Bid 172.75 172.75 143.85 143.85 150.96 150.96
12 1 129.00 129.00 137.70 137.70] NoBid No Bid 178.00 178.00 150.12 150.12 137.85 137.85 164.18 164.18|
13 1 50.00 50.00 87.70 87.70| NoBid No Bid No Bid No Bid 74.52 74.52 94.50 94.50 77.08 77.08
14 1 9.00 9.00 12.95 12.95| NoBid No Bid No Bid No Bid 9.72 9.72 10.30| 10.30 10.75 10.75
15 1 14.00 14.00 17.70 17.70] NoBid No Bid 15.00 15.00 14.04 14.04 15.60 15.60 15.98 15.98
16 2 109.95 219.90 117.95 235.90| WNo Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid 170.63 341.26 169.39 338.78 194.49 388.98
17 1 1,449.00] 1,449.00| 1,449.00] 1,449.00] 1,459.00] 1,459.00/ No Bid No Bid 1,564.92] 1,564.92] 1,545.25|] 1,545.25| 1,596.68] 1,596.68
18 1 36.90 36.90 37.95 37.95 45,00 45.00 NoBid No Bid 39.69 39.69 38.95 38.95 31.90 31.90
19 2 69.79 139.58 72,95 145.90] No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid 80.95 161.90 132.25 264.50 81.49 162.98
20 1 1,339.90{ 1,339.90{ 1,339.95| 1,339.95| 1,399.99] 1,399.99] No Bid No Bid 1,457.95| 1,457.95| 1,385.95] 1,385.95| 1,420.39] 1,420.39
21 1 169.00 169.00 154.80 154.80| No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid 62.63 62.63 180.85 180.85 189.58 189.58
22 2 451.90 903.80 459.95 919.90 448.99 897.98| No Bid No Bid 496.75 993.50 454.35 908.70 494.77 989.54
23 1 37.00 37.00 37.50 37.50| NoBid No Bid No Bid No Bld 40.50 40.50 25.30 25.30 41.32 41.32
24 2 99.00 198.00|Discontinued No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid 106.92 213.84 114.85 229.70 110.19 220.38
25 2 52.99 105.98 44.99 89.98] NoBid No Bid No Bid No Bid 62.63 125.26 45.15 90.30 120.92 241.84
26 2 19.99 39,98 27.70 55.40| No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid 32.35 64.70 17.40 34.80 33.00 66.00
27 2 232.00 464.00 227.70 455.40] WNo Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid 323.99 647.98 236.25 472.50 262.51 525.02
28 2 33.00 66.00 n/a n/a No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid 45.36 90.72 45.85 91.70 53.99 107.98
29 2 12,99 25.98 14.89 29.78] NoBid No Bid No Bid No Bid 12.87 25.74|Discontinued 19.49 38.98
30 2 249.00 498.00 307.70 615.40 525.00| 1,050.00 547.00] 1,094.00 376.92 753.84 357.65 715.30 545.45| 1,090.90
31 2 4,95 9.90 9.50 19.00 8.00 16.00 5.00 10.00 10.26 20.52 4.45 8.90 4.21 8.42
32 2 155.80 311.60 164.95 329.90 198.00 396.00 160.00 320.00 177.98 355.96 158.55 317.10 166.39 332.78
33 2 119.00 238.00 137.70 275.40| No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid 126.36 252.72 122.40 244.80 164.18 328.36
34 2 28.00 56.00 37.70 75.40] No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid 30.24 60.48 90.75 181.50 38.65 77.30
35 2 111.99 223.98 103.46 206.92 100.00 200.00| No Bid No Bid 140.39 280.78 106.80 213.60 143.23 286.46
36 2 31.49 62.98 31.95 63.90] No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid 35.59 71.18 31.40 62.80 36.63 73.26
37 1 119.99 119.99 n/a nfa No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid 151.15 151.15 144.50 144.50 154.21 154.21
38 6 42.60 255.60 n/a n/a No Bid No Bid 55.00 330.00 52.92 317.52 53.90 323.40 53.99 323.94
39 S 32.00 160.00 31.99 159.95| No Bid No Bid 35.00 175.00 37.80 189.00 32.30 161.50 33.06 165.30
Grand Total: 15,969.61 16,103.54 11,968.97 4,056.00 18,401.02 16,517.03 18,924.32
Delivery ARO No response 7-18 ARO 30 Days 2 Weeks ARO 14 Days 10-21 Days or Less 30 Days
Mfr # for item #6 Pelican 1400 w/foam Flashpoint FPUW1560 No Bid No Bid Gator GM-1WEVAA Pellcan 14008 Pelican BPL1650

* B&H quoted alternates for items 16, 19 & 34
** Adorama did not submit pricing on quotation form, It appears that they quoted alternates for items 14 & 16 and quoted for a qty of 1 instead of 2 for item 16.
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