PENSACOLA STATE COLLGEGE

ITB 4-2012-2013

GARBAGE DUMPSTERS BID TABULATION

ITEM | QTY/ ALLIED GREER WASTE WASTE PRO WEST
UNIT WASTE ENTERPRISES | MANAGEMENT FLORIDA
1 |49 Weeks 4586.42 No Bid 4424.79 5927.76 No Bid
2 |49 Weeks 9172.85 8849.34 11855.52
3 |49 Weeks 3057.58 2949.78 3951.84
4 |49 Weeks 4586.42 4424.79 5927.76
5 |49 Weeks 1528.80 1474.89 1975.92
6 |52 Weeks 3242.28 3119.76 4117.44
7 |49 Weeks 3057.58 2422.75 3951.84
8 |49 Weeks 3057.58 242275 3394.80
9 |49 Weeks 4586.42 2654.78 5092.20
10 |52 Weeks 243355 2339.76 2152.80
11 | 49 Weeks 940.80 884.89 1975.92
12 | 49 Weeks 1266.16 1211.32 1352.4
TOTAL 41516.44 37179.60 51676.20
ITEM | QTY/ AS NEEDED PICK UP
UNIT
4 Yard 30.00 46.00 50.00
13 | 8Yard 45.00 68.00 60.00
RECYCLING DUMPSTERS BID TABULATION
ITEM | QTY/ ALLIED GREER WASTE WASTE PRO WEST
UNIT WASTE ENTERPRISES | MANAGEMENT FLORIDA
14 | 49 Weeks 1011.36 No Bid 1573.26 2352.00 No Bid
15 | 49 Weeks 1011.36 1573.26 2352.00
16 | 49 Weeks 1011.36 1573.26 2352.00
17 |49 Weeks 505.68 786.63 1176.00
18 | 49 Weeks 505.68 786.63 1176.00
19 |49 Weeks 505.68 786.63 1176.00
20 | 49 Weeks 1011.36 1573.26 2352.00
21 | 49 Weeks 1011.36 1573.26 2352.00
22 | 49 Weeks 505.68 1573.26 1176.00
23 | 49 Weeks 505.68 1573.26 1176.00
24| 49 Weeks 505.68 1573.26 1176.00
25 | 49 Weeks 505.68 1573.26 1176.00
26 | 49 Weeks 449.93 1573.26 588.00
TOTAL **0046.49 18092.49 20580.00

Note: ** Allied Waste provided a recycling rebate of $206.78 per month for an effective monthly
rate of $592.66 and yearly rate of $7,111.92.




ITEM | QTY/ AS NEEDED PICK UP
UNIT
27 4 Yard 20.00 | \ 40.00 | 50.00 |

RECOMMENDED AWARD TO: Allied Waste for both garbage and recycled container
pickup.

Bid tabulations with award recommendations are posted in the Purchasing Department. Posting
of tabulations normally is completed within three to five days after bid opening.

Failure to file a protest within time prescribed in Section 120.57 (3) (b), Florida Statutes, or
failure to post the bond or other security required by law within the time allowed for filing a
bond shall constitute a waiver of proceeding under Chapter 120, Florida Statutes.

I hereby certify that the prices and bidders herein are valid and have been received in compliance
with Pensacola State College Administrative Code and Florida Law.

Cassie Boatwright, Director
Purchasing and Auxiliary Services




